
..................................................................... 

(Original Signature of Member) 

118TH CONGRESS 
2D SESSION H. R. ll 

To amend the Safe Drinking Water Act to adjust the limits for technical 

assistance, grants for small systems, and the authorization of appropria-

tions for the Drinking Water Infrastructure Risk and Resilience Pro-

gram. 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Mr. DELUZIO introduced the following bill; which was referred to the 

Committee on llllllllllllll 

A BILL 
To amend the Safe Drinking Water Act to adjust the limits 

for technical assistance, grants for small systems, and 

the authorization of appropriations for the Drinking 

Water Infrastructure Risk and Resilience Program. 

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-1

tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 2

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE. 3

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Water Authority Cy-4

bersecurity Protection Act’’. 5

VerDate Nov 24 2008 13:22 Dec 10, 2024 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00001 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6201 C:\USERS\BMSENGER\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\DELUZI_0
December 10, 2024 (1:22 p.m.)

G:\M\18\DELUZI\DELUZI_064.XML

g:\V\G\121024\G121024.005.xml           (949010|4)



2 

SEC. 2. DRINKING WATER INFRASTRUCTURE RISK AND RE-1

SILIENCE PROGRAM. 2

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 1433(g)(1) of the Safe 3

Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 300i–2(g)(1)) is amended 4

by striking ‘‘2020 and 2021’’ and inserting ‘‘2026 and 5

2027’’. 6

(b) TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE.—Section 1433(g)(4) of 7

the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 300i–2(g)(4)) is 8

amended by striking ‘‘$5,000,000’’ and inserting 9

‘‘$10,000,000’’. 10

(c) GRANTS FOR SMALL SYSTEMS.—Section 11

1433(g)(5) of the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 12

300i–2(g)(5)) is amended by striking ‘‘$10,000,000’’ and 13

inserting ‘‘$20,000,000’’. 14

(d) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Section 15

1433(g)(6) of the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 16

300i–2(g)(6)) is amended— 17

(1) by striking ‘‘$25,000,000’’ and inserting 18

‘‘$50,000,000’’; and 19

(2) by striking ‘‘2020 and 2021’’ and inserting 20

‘‘2026 and 2027’’. 21

VerDate Nov 24 2008 13:22 Dec 10, 2024 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00002 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6201 C:\USERS\BMSENGER\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\DELUZI_0
December 10, 2024 (1:22 p.m.)

G:\M\18\DELUZI\DELUZI_064.XML

g:\V\G\121024\G121024.005.xml           (949010|4)



....................................................


(Original Signature of Member)


		118th CONGRESS
2d Session





		



		





H. R. __

To amend the Safe Drinking Water Act to adjust the limits for technical assistance, grants for small systems, and the authorization of appropriations for the Drinking Water Infrastructure Risk and Resilience Program.




IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Mr. Deluzio introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________




A BILL

To amend the Safe Drinking Water Act to adjust the limits for technical assistance, grants for small systems, and the authorization of appropriations for the Drinking Water Infrastructure Risk and Resilience Program.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 

SECTION 1. Short title.

This Act may be cited as the “Water Authority Cybersecurity Protection Act”.


SEC. 2. Drinking Water Infrastructure Risk and Resilience Program.

(a) In general.—Section 1433(g)(1) of the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 300i–2(g)(1)) is amended by striking “2020 and 2021” and inserting “2026 and 2027”.


(b) Technical assistance.—Section 1433(g)(4) of the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 300i–2(g)(4)) is amended by striking “$5,000,000” and inserting “$10,000,000”.


(c) Grants for small systems.—Section 1433(g)(5) of the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 300i–2(g)(5)) is amended by striking “$10,000,000” and inserting “$20,000,000”.


(d) Authorization of appropriations.—Section 1433(g)(6) of the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 300i–2(g)(6)) is amended— 


(1) by striking “$25,000,000” and inserting “$50,000,000”; and


(2) by striking “2020 and 2021” and inserting “2026 and 2027”.






  
    G:\M\18\DELUZI\DELUZI_064.XML XXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX 12/10/2024 13:22 XXXXXXXX 10/30/2024 3:10 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX   949010|4  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
    
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
  
 
  
 I 
 118th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 H. R. __ 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
  
  Mr. Deluzio introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________ 
 
 A BILL 
 To amend the Safe Drinking Water Act to adjust the limits for technical assistance, grants for small systems, and the authorization of appropriations for the Drinking Water Infrastructure Risk and Resilience Program. 
 
  
  1. Short title This Act may be cited as the   Water Authority Cybersecurity Protection Act. 
  2. Drinking Water Infrastructure Risk and Resilience Program 
  (a) In general Section 1433(g)(1) of the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 300i–2(g)(1)) is amended by striking  2020 and 2021 and inserting  2026 and 2027. 
  (b) Technical assistance Section 1433(g)(4) of the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 300i–2(g)(4)) is amended by striking  $5,000,000 and inserting  $10,000,000. 
  (c) Grants for small systems Section 1433(g)(5) of the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 300i–2(g)(5)) is amended by striking  $10,000,000 and inserting  $20,000,000. 
  (d) Authorization of appropriations Section 1433(g)(6) of the Safe Drinking Water Act (42 U.S.C. 300i–2(g)(6)) is amended— 
  (1) by striking  $25,000,000 and inserting  $50,000,000; and 
  (2) by striking  2020 and 2021 and inserting  2026 and 2027. 
 


